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Inverted Commas

For each passage below, add in the missing inverted commas.

I have just finished reading 
this book. It was thrilling, 
said William.

The customer explained, This 
is not working. Can I have a 
replacement please?

Sam’s mother warned him, 
Stay away from the cooker.  
There is a pan of boiling water 
on the hob.

People in the audience were 
yelling, More! We want more!

Mr Andrew asked, Will you 
play in goal Phil? Jameel has 
an injury.

I can’t hear you. Speak up! 
shouted Abdul.

Put your books away 
everybody. It is break time, 
explained the teacher.

Sue said, I’ve just put the 
kettle on. Would you like a 
cup of tea?

Put your coat on, Poppy. It’s 
cold out there today, said her 
mother.

Is this the way to the 
hospital? I am lost, inquired 
Chris.

Dad said, It’s time for bed.  
You have school in the 
morning.

Sorry I am late. My train was 
cancelled, explained the lady.
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Inverted Commas

For each passage below, add in the missing inverted commas.

“I have just finished reading 
this book. It was thrilling,”
said William.

The customer explained, “This 
is not working. Can I have a 
replacement please?”

Sam’s mother warned him, 
“Stay away from the cooker.  
There is a pan of boiling water 
on the hob.”

People in the audience were 
yelling, “More! We want 
more!”

Mr Andrew asked, “Will you 
play in goal Phil? Jameel has 
an injury.”

“I can’t hear you. Speak up!”
shouted Abdul.

“Put your books away 
everybody. It is break time,” 
explained the teacher.

Sue said, “I’ve just put the 
kettle on. Would you like a 
cup of tea?”

“Put your coat on, Poppy. It’s 
cold out there today,” said her 
mother.

“Is this the way to the 
hospital? I am lost,” inquired 
Chris.

Dad said, “It’s time for bed.  
You have school in the 
morning.”

“Sorry I am late. My train was 
cancelled,” explained the lady.
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Inverted Commas

For each passage below, add in the missing inverted commas.

Rachel asked, Has anyone 
seen my bag? I’ve lost it.

I’m really tired. This has been 
such a long journey, sighed 
the weary man.

The waitress explained, We 
have a selection of specials 
this evening. Would you like 
to look at the board?

Wait here. I’ll go and see 
where they are, said the 
frustrated mum.

The boy shouted, Watch out! 
There’s a car approaching!

The girl said excitedly, I’m 
going to get an ice cream.  
Would you like one?

What time is it? I think I’m 
late, said Tom.

Samir said, I’m bored. What 
shall we do?

Let’s go to the beach. It’s such 
a beautiful day, Jessie said 
excitedly.

Which dress do you think 
suits me? I think this, said 
Maggie holding up the purple 
one.

Roger said, I don’t know if I’ll 
be able to come. I need to 
check the calendar at home.

The doctor explained calmly,  
This won’t hurt. Please don’t 
worry.
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Inverted Commas

For each passage below, add in the missing inverted commas.

Rachel asked, “Has anyone 
seen my bag? I’ve lost it.”

“I’m really tired. This has been 
such a long journey,” sighed 
the weary man.

The waitress explained, “We 
have a selection of specials 
this evening. Would you like 
to look at the board?”

“Wait here. I’ll go and see 
where they are,” said the 
frustrated mum.

The boy shouted, “Watch out! 
There’s a car approaching!”

The girl said excitedly, “I’m 
going to get an ice cream.  
Would you like one?”

“What time is it? I think I’m 
late,” said Tom.

Samir said, “I’m bored. What 
shall we do?”

“Let’s go to the beach. It’s 
such a beautiful day,” Jessie 
said excitedly.

“Which dress do you think 
suits me? I think this,” said 
Maggie holding up the purple 
one.

Roger said, “I don’t know if 
I’ll be able to come. I need to 
check the calendar at home.”

The doctor explained calmly, 
“This won’t hurt. Please don’t 
worry.”
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